3/29/2015 Outlook.com Print Message
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Re: Solar Car Team Seeking for CS Department's Support

From: Darnall, Aaron R (adarnall@illinois.edu)
Sent: Fri 3/20/15 1:40 PM
To:  Lee, Jye Sze (jlee641@illinois.edu)

Cc:  1llinisolarcar@gmail.com (illinisolarcar@gmail.com); Elliott, Nicole Marie
(elliottn@illinois.edu); ISC Treasurer (illinisolarcar.treasurer@gmail.com); Curtis, Beverly A
(beurtis@illinois.edu); Varodayan, David (dpv@illinois.edu)

Nicole,
Please work with Bev at ECE to transfer $500 (from U4R) to support the Illini Solar Car project.

Thanks,

Aaron

Aaron Darnall | Assistant to the Head | University of Illinois - Department of Computer Science | 2230 Siebel
Center, M/C 258 | 201 N. Goodwin Ave. Urbana, IL 61801 | Phone: 217-333-2444 | Email: adarnall@illinois.edu -
- Assistant & Scheduling: Erin Henkelman (erink@illinois.edu)

On Mar 20, 2015, at 12:30 PM, Lee Jye Sze <jlee641(@illinois.edu> wrote:
Hello,
Thank you! Your funding will certainly help us in getting more work done at this stage.

To answer your question,

1) We were allocated $5000 matching fund from Engineering Design Council. We are also
requesting funding from other departments(Aerospace Department, MatSE Department,
Physics Department and Nuclear, Radiological and Plasma Engineering Department) but
we have yet to hear from them yet. We will apply for funding from the ECE Department
after spring break. MechSE's funding period is in Fall so we'll apply during that time.

i1) We have a departmental account(or gift account) in the ECE Department. One of our
faculty advisors, Professor Varodayan is overlooking that account for us. For funding

transfer, please contact Beverly Curtis(bcurtis@illinois.edu), the business manager in the
ECE office.

I hope I answered your questions well.
Besides, would you like us to keep you updated on our progress?

Thank you for your time,
Jye Sze

From: adarnall@illinois.edu
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3/29/2015

Outlook.com Print Message

To: jlee641@illinois.edu

CC: illinisolarcar@gmail.com; elliottn(@illinois.edu
Subject: Re: Solar Car Team Seeking for CS Department's Support

Date: Fri, 20 Mar 2015 14:22:32 +0000
Hello,

On behalf of Department Head Rob Rutenbar, and the department of Computer Science,
we’d be happy to help sponsor the Solar car team this year. A few questions if [ may, what
other academic departments are helping sponsor this event, and at what amounts? As well,
which department houses the team and who would we work with to arrange the funding
transfer?

Thanks,

Aaron

Aaron Darnall | Assistant to the Head | University of Illinois - Department of Computer Science |
2230 Siebel Center, M/C 258 | 201 N. Goodwin Ave. Urbana, IL 61801 | Phone: 217-333-2444 |
Email: adarnall@illinois.edu -- Assistant & Scheduling: Erin Henkelman (erink@illinois.edu)

From: jyesze.lee@hotmail.com [mailto:jyesze.lee@hotmail.com] On Behalf Of Lee
Jye Sze

Sent: Tuesday, March 10, 2015 11:01 AM

To: Stahl, Karen D

Cc: illinisolarcar@gmail.com

Subject: FW: Solar Car Team Seeking for CS Department's Support

Dear Ms. Stahl,

Sorry for not clarifying in my previous email but we would like to request for
S500 from the CS Department. This money will be used to purchase materials
and tools to facilitate our team members learning.

Please tell me if you think we are requesting too much.

Thank you for your time,

Jye Sze Lee
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3/29/2015

Outlook.com Print Message

From: jlee641@illinois.edu

To: kstahl@illinois.edu

CC: illinisolarcar@gmail.com

Subject: Solar Car Team Seeking for CS Department's Support
Date: Mon, 9 Mar 2015 08:39:57 -0500

Dear Ms. Stahl,

Thank you for taking time to talk with me last Friday about possibility of lllini
Solar Car to receive financial support from the Computer Science Department.

Please find our proposal in the attachment of this email. Please also feel free to
contact me should you need more details.

| appreciate your help in conveying our request to the right person and | look
forward to hearing from you.

Sincerely,
Jye Sze Lee

Illini Solar Car Vice President External

<IlliniSolarCarCSProposal.pdf>
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